
 

Patient Organisations 

In line with the Association of the British Pharmaceutical Industry (ABPI) Code of Practice, 
Novo Nordisk UK are providing details of the Patient Organisations it partners with, 
including the nature and financial element of each instance of support. 

2019 support provided to UK Patient Organisations 

Patient 
Organisation  

Description of activity or project support  
Net value of 
support (£) 

Association of 
Children's Diabetes 

Sponsorship of the 13th ACDC Annual 
Conference (1st Feb. 2019, stand space) 

£3,000.00 

Child Growth 
Foundation 

Health professional awareness/education 
project 

£4,580.83 

Diabetes UK 
Sponsorship of the 7th National Diabetes in 
Pregnancy Annual Conference (exhibition stand) 

£6,000.00 

Diabetes UK 
Support of the Diabetes UK Clinical Champions 
Programme 2018 

£75,000.00 

Diabetes UK 

Support towards the 'Tomorrows Leaders 
Training Programme 2018', which provides 
Diabetes Specialist Nurses and Dieticians with 
the skills and confidence to become strong local 
leaders to ensure that the best diabetes care is 
delivered in their area 

£20,539.00 

Diabetes UK 
Sponsorship of the West Midlands Footcare 
Conference (13 Nov. 2018, stand space) 

£83.33 

Diabetes UK 

Sponsorship of the Diabetes UK Professional 
Conference (6-8 Mar. 2019,  Silver Corporate 
Sponsorship, 2x Symposium, Workshop, 
Exhibition Stand Space) 

£78,782.00 

Diabetes UK 

Support towards the Pharmacy Leaders 
Programme 2019,  which provides Pharmacists 
with the skills and confidence to become strong 
local leaders to ensure that the best diabetes 
care is delivered in their area 

£46,587.00 

Diabetes UK 
Support towards the 'Tomorrows Leaders 
Training Programme 2019', which provides 
Diabetes Specialist Nurses, Dieticians and 

£34,172.00 



Podiatrists with the skills and confidence to 
become strong local leaders to ensure that the 
best diabetes care is delivered in their area 

Diabetes UK 
Support of the Diabetes UK Clinical Champions 
Programme 

£181,330.00 

Diabetes UK 
Sponsorship of the 8th National Diabetes in 
Pregnancy Annual Conference (21 Nov. 2019, 
exhibition stand) 

£6,000.00 

Diabetes UK 
To support the update of the orange booklet for 
people newly diagnosed with Type 2 diabetes 

£8,500.00 

Diabetes UK 
Support of ChangeLabs 2019 (series of 
workshops for healthcare professionals working 
in diabetes to improve diabetes care) 

£30,000.00 

Diabetes UK 
Sponsorship of the Diabetes UK South West 
Professional Conference (9 Oct. 2019, exhibitor 
stand) 

£450.00 

Diabetes UK 
Sponsorship of the Walsall Footcare Conference 
(12 Nov. 2019) 

£100.00 

Diabetes UK 
Sponsorship of YDEF ABCD of E (21-22 Nov. 
2019) 

£5,000.00 

Diabetes UK Donation 

Provision of 
Glucagon® 
Hypokits® by Novo 
Nordisk to support 
the Type 1 events 
organised and run 
by Diabetes UK 
during 2019 

Haemophilia 
Scotland 

To support the review of Extended Half Life 
Product Animation Education Material 

£150.00 

Haemophilia 
Scotland 

Support of an event for 12 young people with 
bleeding disorders 

£1,621.00 

Heart UK 12 months corporate membership £24,000.00 

The Haemophilia 
Society 

Donation towards a family day activity £5,000.00 



The Patients 
Association 

12 months corporate membership £12,000.00 

The Patients 
Association 

Sponsorship of a project to empower patients 
and provide information and support when 
switched to biosimilar medications (May 2019 - 
Oct. 2019) 

£12,500.00 

Turner Syndrome 
Support Society (TSS) 

Sponsorship of Annual conference 2019 and 
membership database update 

£4,166.67 

  

 


